
ABOUT US

Dr. Navid Rahmani is an internationally recognized,
Board Certified Periodontist and best rated dental
implant specialist. All procedures are performed on
Upper East Side in our Midtown NYC dental
implants center.
Free Consultation by Dr. Navid Rahmani at NYC
Dental Implants Center: ☎ (212) 256-0000

The dental office uses only the newest and most
advanced dental equipment available on the market
in USA. Dental implants are from Straumann,
headquartered in Basel, Switzerland. It`s the largest
and most advanced dental implant company in the
world. Choose the top quality medical grade titanium
or titanium alloy, the same materials used for other
bone implants and for orthopedic joint replacements.

Our primary mission is to deliver the best and most
comprehensive periodontal and implant therapy to
help you not only save your natural teeth but to
rebuild function and esthetics as well.

Experience, high-quality materials, and precision are
the key to produce an aesthetically perfect dental
implant. Rely on Dr. Rahmani for the best dental care
in NYC.

Dr. Rahmani of NYC Dental Implants Center in
Manhattan offers best in class treatments to patients
from around the New York City area and NYC
tourists.

WORKING HOURS:

Monday - Thursday: 8am -  6pm
Friday: 8am - 2pm
Saturday, Sunday: Closed

CONTACT INFORMATION

121 East 60th St, Ste 6C2,

New York, NY 10065

(60th St. btw Park Ave / Lex Ave)

(212) 256-0000

https://www.nycdentalimplantscenter.com

Email: info@nycdentalimplantscenter.com

FOLLOW US

S A M E  D A Y  D E N T A L  I M P L A N T  S O L U T I O N
F O R  M I S S I N G  T E E T H

https://www.nycdentalimplantscenter.com/
https://g.page/dental-implants-nyc-dentist
https://www.facebook.com/NYCDentalImplantsCenter
https://twitter.com/DrNRahmani
https://www.linkedin.com/company/nyc-dental-implant-center/
https://www.instagram.com/drrahmani_perio/
https://www.youtube.com/channel/UCl5maMqPeye1m3Bf2y8Nxlw
https://drnavidrahmani.tumblr.com/
https://www.pinterest.com/nycdentalimpiantscenter

